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Anthidium manicatum 
(European wool carder 
bee) 

Insect Victoria 17 April 2020 4 May 2020  
 

The NBMCC reached consensus that Anthidium 
manicatum is not a pest of national significance as 
defined by the NEBRA, as it is unlikely to cause 
nationally significant impacts on the environment, 
people (social amenity and human infrastructure) or 
business activity. The NBMCC also agreed that A. 
manicatum is not technically feasible to eradicate.  

Coptotermes gestroi 
(Asian subterranean 
termite) 

Insect Commonwealth
(Christmas 
Island) 

15 June 2018 8 January 2020 
 

The NBMCC reached consensus that Coptotermes 
gestroi is nationally significant as defined by the NEBRA, 
due to its potential to cause significant impacts on the 
environment and people (human infrastructure), but it 
is not technically feasible or cost-beneficial to eradicate 
from Christmas Island. This is because C. gestroi is 
widespread on Christmas Island and appears to have 
been present there for at least 50 years.  

Spigelia anthelmia 
(Western Indian 
pinkroot) 

Weed NT 17 May 2019 20 November 
2019  

The NBMCC reached a consensus that Spigelia 
anthelmia is not a pest of national significance as 
defined by the NEBRA, as it is unlikely to cause 
nationally significant impacts on the environment, 
people (social amenity and human infrastructure) or 
business activity. Therefore, it is not eligible for 
nationally cost-shared eradication under the NEBRA. 

 


